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Guidance for managers of unsuccessful development centre applicants 
If a member of your team has been unsuccessful in their application for a place on a 
development centre, the following lays out the support you can expect from Organisational 
Learning (OL) and the actions you should take in further supporting the development of your 
team member.   

Encourage your team member to have a development conversation with a member of the 
Organisational Learning team. This conversation will help your team member explore where 
they want to go with their development and how this links with their career goals. We may 
ask you as the manager to input into this conversation as well.  

We would strongly encourage your team member to undertake a 360 review before coming 
to the conversation with OL. Details of how to set up the 360 are below in this document.  
The individual should then share their 360 review report with OL before the development 
discussion and we will be able to help both you and the individual interpret the results of 
their 360 report.  

Your team member can book their discussion with OL by emailing hr.learning@lse.ac.uk . 
We aim to ensure that a development conversation takes place within four weeks of the 
initial email contact.  

Following the discussion with OL, you will both be provided with an overview of 
recommended development areas, which you should use to co-create a development plan 
linked to both the current CDR cycle and longer term personal and career development 
activities.  

In co-creating this plan, the following resources may be of use:  

Section 2 of the PS staff career development toolkit contains a guide to how to plan short, 
mid and long-term development goals and has a suggested personal development plan 
form. You can find this here: Career-Development-Toolkit-2-How-to-develop-your-career-
v2.pdf (lse.ac.uk) 

The setting objectives page of the CDR toolkit contains a short video on how to set SMART 
objectives, which are useful in setting manageable and realistic development goals. You can 
find this here: Setting objectives (lse.ac.uk) 

The supporting ongoing development page for managers outlines both simple and more 
complex ways that you can support the development of your team as a group and as 
individuals. You can find this page here: Supporting ongoing development (lse.ac.uk) 

Once you have co-created the action plan, it is important to check in on progress regularly. 
This will involve holding each other accountable. You should ensure that your team member 
is taking ownership of and progressing their development plan and you should make sure 
you are supporting this in ways you have agreed between you. This should become a regular 
part of your 1-2-1s and of the CDR cycle.  

mailto:hr.learning@lse.ac.uk
https://info.lse.ac.uk/staff/divisions/Human-Resources/Assets/Documents/OLL/Career-Development-Guide/Career-Development-Toolkit-2-How-to-develop-your-career-v2.pdf
https://info.lse.ac.uk/staff/divisions/Human-Resources/Assets/Documents/OLL/Career-Development-Guide/Career-Development-Toolkit-2-How-to-develop-your-career-v2.pdf
https://info.lse.ac.uk/staff/divisions/Human-Resources/Organisational-learning/CDR-Toolkit/Setting-objectives
https://info.lse.ac.uk/staff/divisions/Human-Resources/Organisational-learning/LSE-Manager/Supporting-ongoing-development
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Setting up a 360 review 

Our Teams and Leadership tool helps you and your team step back from the day to day, 
identify improvement and implement change. The online platform provides a structured way 
for every team to boost their own performance, engagement and wellbeing. Through 
personalised learning journeys, team and individual reviews, expert resources, and how-to 
guides.  

The platform allows you to set up anonymous 360 feedback reviews for you as an individual 
and for your team as a group. The guidance below explains how to set this up.  

If you have not done so already, contact hr.learning@lse.ac.uk to request that an account is 
set up for you. Once this has been done, go to https://lse.teamsandleadership.net/ and 
create a log in with your LSE email and a password of your choosing. This can be done by 
clicking on the register tab.  

 

Once you have registered, click on get started.  

 

 

mailto:hr.learning@lse.ac.uk
https://lse.teamsandleadership.net/
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You have various options on the next screen. You can set up an individual review, a team 
review or look through the expert guidance.  

An individual review is for you to get 360 feedback from your team, key stakeholders and 
those you work with to find out more about what others perceive as you strengths and as 
areas for development. You can conduct the individual review as a standard review or as a 
leadership review. The leadership 360 review covers everything you need to know about your 
leadership style. For a development discussion with OL we would recommend conducting 
either the individual of the leadership 360 depending on the individual’s role at LSE.  

You complete the review and get feedback from colleagues from their experience of working 
with you. Your report allows you to compare their views with your own and gives tailor-made 
suggestions for your development. 

A team review is for your team to get 360 feedback about the ways you work as a team. This 
feedback will be made up of anonymous feedback from each of the members of the team 
and key stakeholders whom you invite to provide feedback.  

The team review covers everything you need to know about your team's strengths and 
development needs by focusing on the areas that are proven to make a difference to 
effective team performance.   

Any team can use this as a confidential snapshot of how the team is functioning. Use this as 
part of a team away day, as part of your ongoing team development or simply to identify 
where you may need extra support. The team review should not be used for individual 
development discussions with OL.  

What do we mean by 360 feedback? 

360-degree feedback is a process of gathering feedback from a person's direct reports, 
peers, colleagues, and supervisor(s). The process also encourages and collects self-
evaluation by the reviewee themselves.  

360 feedback can also include relevant feedback from sources external to the School. To 
truly be valuable 360 feedback, data should be captured from a range of representative 
stakeholders and this should not just be stakeholders with whom the reviewee(s) have a 
close or good working relationship.  

Setting up a review 

Click on the type of review you would like to set up.   
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And follow the instructions on the next screen 

 

You will be asked for a name for your review and will be given a link and a template email to 
send to stakeholders to request feedback. If you are conducting a team review, you will be 
given two different links and template emails, one for your team and one for your identified 
stakeholders. This is to ensure that, whilst the feedback is anonymous, you can identify what 
the team have said against what your stakeholders have said.  

Once you have sent out requests for feedback, the answers your team and other 
stakeholders give will be condensed into a report for you. This report will be available for you 
to view after a minimum of three people have responded. The responses given are 
completely anonymous and the report and the data it contains are entirely confidential to 
you. No one else can see this.  

We recommend giving people two weeks to respond and sending out a reminder to your 
stakeholders a few days day before your review closes.  

As part of this process, you should also conduct a self-assessment by inputting into the 
survey yourself.  

All stakeholders have the ability to highlight up to four areas that they feel are development 
needs for the individual or for the team.  

How do I access the results?  

Click on review dashboard and you will be able to open and download your report, assuming 
at least three people have responded. 
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How do I interpret my results?  

Your report will give you both quantitative and qualitative data. As you can see in the 
example below, the report will give numerical score for your self-assessment and for your 
contributors’ comments. These are also benchmarked against all scores in the database. At 
the end of the report, you will be able to see all of your qualitative responses.  

For the quantitative data you will see a self-assessment or team score in blue and a 
contributor or stakeholder score in pink. These scores are benchmarked to the platform’s 
database. The platform is used by a range of public and third sector organisations and the 
database shows the average score for the area across all of the organisations who use the 
platform. This can be useful in benchmarking yourself against others in similar 
organisations.  

 

 

The report will highlight areas that, based on these data, are considered development areas 
for you or your team. Linked to this it will provide you with expert guidance and learning 
activities you can undertake in these areas, as per the example on the next page.  

Where a report is to be used to inform a development conversation with a member of the 
OL team, please ensure that the report is shared with the relevant member of OL at least 
two days before the meeting. OL commit to ensuring that the content of your report 
remains confidential and will not be shared more widely.  
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If you have any questions about setting up or conducting your review, contact us at 
hr.learning@lse.ac.uk 

Click on the links to 
find development 

activities and 
further reading for 

this topic area 


